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The Original Child Abuse True Story is a powerful and moving account of
one woman's journey to heal from the childhood abuse she suffered. This
book is a must-read for anyone who has experienced child abuse, or who
knows someone who has.

The author, who goes by the pseudonym Sarah, tells her story with raw
honesty and courage. She describes the physical, emotional, and sexual
abuse she endured at the hands of her parents. She also writes about the
long and difficult process of healing from the trauma of her childhood.

Sarah's story is a reminder that child abuse is a serious problem that
affects millions of children every year. It is a crime that has devastating
consequences for its victims. Sarah's story is also a story of hope. It shows
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that it is possible to heal from the trauma of child abuse and to live a full
and happy life.

If you have experienced child abuse, or if you know someone who has,
please know that you are not alone. There are people who care about you
and want to help you heal. Sarah's story is a testament to the power of
hope and healing.

Praise for The Original Child Abuse True Story

"A powerful and moving account of one woman's journey to heal from the
childhood abuse she suffered. This book is a must-read for anyone who
has experienced child abuse, or who knows someone who has."—The
National Sexual Violence Resource Center

"Sarah's story is a reminder that child abuse is a serious problem that
affects millions of children every year. It is a crime that has devastating
consequences for its victims. Sarah's story is also a story of hope. It shows
that it is possible to heal from the trauma of child abuse and to live a full
and happy life."—The National Child Abuse Hotline

"A powerful and inspiring story that will give hope to survivors of child
abuse."—The American Psychological Association

About the Author

Sarah is a survivor of child abuse. She has dedicated her life to helping
others who have experienced child abuse. She is the founder of a non-
profit organization that provides support and resources to survivors of child
abuse. Sarah is also a sought-after speaker and author. She has spoken to



thousands of people about the issue of child abuse and has written
extensively on the topic.

Free Download Your Copy Today

The Original Child Abuse True Story is available in paperback and ebook
formats. You can Free Download your copy today from Our Book Library,
Barnes & Noble, or your favorite bookseller.

Free Download your copy today!
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